
Ranked List No. : 96/2025/DOJ Cat. No. : 445/2023

   KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

The following is the list of candidates for selection to the post of Clerk (From Ex-servicemen only) (Cat
No.445/2023)on Rs.26500-60700/- in NCC/Sainik Welfare Department in Idukki District, found suitable by the
Commission and arranged in the order of merit on the basis of OMR Test held on 04/05/2024. This Ranked List is
brought into force with effect from 31.01.2025

Ranked List for the post of Clerk (From Ex-servicemen only) on Rs. Rs.26500-60700/- in
NCC/Sainik Welfare Department in Idukki District

NOTIFICATION

RemarksDOBReg.NoRank Name Commy

Main List

1 1011218 15/05/1985 EXRAGESH R

2 1036528 10/05/1982 EXREJIMON GEORGE

3 1037533 EZHAVA09/04/1985 EXVIJESH VIJAYAN

4 1036412 M-MUSLIM15/04/1984 EXAJAS V M

5 1036289 04/01/1980 EXANISH KUMAR O S

6 1036560 EZHAVA31/01/1981 EXPRADEEP KUMAR P

7 1029612 30/05/1977 EXSAJEEV KUMAR S S

8 1012156 HINDU NADAR10/05/1989 EXVIPIN RAJ RU

9 1036951 EZHAVA20/03/1978 EXBINEESH P S

10 1036813 07/10/1984 EXANOOP PRATHAPACHANDRAN

11 1036267 15/04/1982 EXSHINE JOY

12 1036293 M-MUSLIM29/05/1982 EXSULFICAR K MOOSA

13 1036379 30/04/1984 EXJAYASANKAR V

14 1036925 03/05/1981 EXSOLOMON CHACKO

15 1030590 M-MUSLIM06/03/1989 EXNISHAD K

Supplementary List

Ezhava/Thiyya/Billava

1 1037408 EZHAVA22/02/1981 EXMAHESH VIMALKUMAR

2 1036749 EZHAVA22/04/1983 EXVIJESH R

3 1036366 EZHAVA05/01/1983 EXANEESH V M

4 1037618 EZHAVA22/04/1979 EXRAJEEV P R

Scheduled Caste
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RemarksDOBReg.NoRank Name Commy

Nil

Scheduled Tribe

Nil

Muslim

Nil

Latin Catholics/A.I

1 1017469 LC28/04/1984 EXSALI JAMES

OBC

Nil

Viswakarma

Nil

SIUC Nadar

Nil

Scheduled Caste Converts to Christianity

Nil

Dheevara

Nil

Hindu Nadar

Nil

Economically Weaker Section

1 1037543 FORWARD SUB
CASTE (EWS)

11/09/1983 EXLALU VARGHESE

List of Differently Abled Candidates for 4% Reservation

Low Vision

Nil

Deaf and Hard of Hearing

Nil

Locomotor Disability including Cerebral Palsy, leprosy cured, Dw, AAV

Nil

Autism(M),SLD, Mental Illness & Multiple disability

Nil
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NOTE (1) :- The Ranked List shall remain in force for a minimum period of one year and a maximum period of three
years provided that the said list will not continue to be in force if a new list after the expiry of the minimum period of
one year is published. Candidates from the Ranked List will be advised for appointment in accordance with the rules
and orders regarding reservation and rotation as amended from time to time, if applicable, against vacancies reported
to the Commission during the pendency of the Ranked List. As the advice for appointment depends on the occurrence
of vacancies there is no guarantee that all the candidates included in the Ranked List will secure appointment. The
candidates remaining in the Ranked List at the time of cancellation will have no claim at all for appointment on the
basis of the inclusion of their names in the Ranked List

NOTE (2) :- According to the existing procedure, revaluation of Answer Script is not allowed. But Answer Scripts will
be rechecked if the candidates apply for through their One Time Registration profile from the Commission's official
website www.keralapsc.gov.in by remitting the prescribed fee of Rs. 85/- (Rupees Eighty Five only). The fee can be
remitted by e-payment through the portal. Applications submitted in any other manner will not be considered. A period
of 15 (Fifteen) days time to apply for rechecking of Answer Scripts will be allowed to candidates with effect from the
date on which the Ranked List is uploaded in the website of the Commission (ie. ,on or before 26/02/2025)

NOTE (3) :- -Candidates who wish to obtain a photocopy of their OMR Answer Sheets (Part A & Part B) relating to this
selection shall submit online Application through their One Time Registration profile from the official website of the
Commission, www.keralapsc.gov.in by remitting the prescribed Fee of Rs. 335/- (Rupees Three Hundred and
ThirtyFive only) via e-payment mode available in the portal. A period of 15 (Fifteen) days time to apply for photocopy
of OMR sheets will be allowed to candidates with effect from the date on which the Ranked List is uploaded in the
website of the Commission (ie.,on or before 26/02/2025 ). Application submitted in any other manner will not be
considered. A copy of answer sheet will be issued only once to a candidate. Copies of OMR sheets invalidated due to
any defect will not be issued.

NOTE (4) :-The entries put in column (5) are based on the Communities specified by the candidate in their Application
forms and proved by them with necessary documents. The candidate whose Communities have not been correctly
noted in the Ranked List as proved by them in their Application should intimate the fact to the District Officer,Kerala
Public Service Commission District Office, Idukki,Kattappana P.O Pin -685508 within one month from the date of
publication of the Ranked List to get the benefit of Reservation to which they are entitled to. In the absence of timely
information regarding discrepancies if any, the candidate will be advised as incorporated in the Ranked List

NOTE (5) :- The candidates who wish to relinquish their claim for advice from the Ranked List shall submit an
application either by post or in person at the KPSC District Office concerned in the format prescribed by the
Commission. The format is available in the official website of the Commission. The request for relinquishment in
respect of those who do not submit the relinquishment application in the format prescribed by the Commission will not
be honoured under any circumstance. The request for relinquishment shall be duly attested by a Gazetted Officer of
State/ Central Government with Signature, Name, Designation and Office Seal along with a notarized affidavit and a
self attested copy of an ID proof bearing photograph as enlisted in the general conditions. The request for
relinquishment received within 15 days from the date of publication of Ranked List in the official website of the
Commission (ie.,on or before 26/02/2025) will be honoured against the requisitions of vacancies that are pending with
the Commission up to the finalization of the Ranked List. After the publication of the Ranked List, the request for
relinquishment will be considered only if, such request is received on or before the date of receipt of requisition, based
on which he is to be advised.

NOTE (6) :-Since a common OMR Test with common candidates was conducted for the post, the marks awarded to
the candidates included in this Ranked List and mark of OMR test relating to all the candidates, who appeared for the
test will be published only after the publication of entire Ranked Lists (including NCA selections),which will be finalized
on the basis of the common test for each post. The result of rechecking of OMR answer scripts will be intimated in due
course. But photocopy of the OMR answer scripts will be issued only after the publication of the Ranked Lists for all
the posts finalized on the basis of the common test.

NOTE (7) :-The A part and B part of OMR scripts will be destroyed after completing 6 months period from the date of
finalization of the Ranked Lists included in the common test.
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Office of the Kerala Public Service Commission
District Office, IDUKKI

(Approved for Issue),

Section Officer

E - Ezhava/Thiyya/Billava, SC - Scheduled Caste, ST - Scheduled Tribe, M - Muslim/Mappila, LC/AI - Latin
Catholics/Anglo Indian, OBC - Other Backward Class, V - Viswakarma, SIUC N - SIUC Nadar, SCCC - Scheduled
Caste Converts to Christianity, D - Dheevara, H Nadar - Hindu Nadar, EWS-Economically Weaker Section, DA-
Differently Abled, LV- Low Vision, HI - Hearing Impairment, LD/CP- Locomotor Disability /Cerebral Palsy EX-Ex-
Servicemen

( By Order of the Commission )

SHAJI KACHUMPROON
DISTRICT OFFICER

KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
District Office, IDUKKI


