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   KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

The following is the list of candidates for selection to the post of WOMAN FIRE AND RESCUE OFFICER (TRAINEE)
FIRST NCA- EZHAVA/THIYYA/BILLAVA (Cat.No.289/2023) on Rs. 20000-45800/- (PR) in FIRE AND RESCUE
SERVICES DEPARTMENT in KOLLAM DISTRICT found suitable by the Commission and arranged in the order of
merit based on the OMR test held on 10.02.2024,  Physical Measurement and Physical Efficiency Test held
on 08.10.2024, 09.10.2024 and 10.10.2024 and Swimming Test held on 21.12.2024 and 23.12.2024  for recruitment
against the NCA vacancies for Ezhava/Thiyya/Billava Community only. This NCA Ranked List is brought into force
with effect from  06.02.2025 and will be valid until candidates are advised and appointed against vacancies that arise
due to the paucity of candidates belonging to Ezhava/Thiyya/Billava Community ,during the currency of Mother
Ranked List published on 03.04.2023 (Cat.No.245/2020) for the post.

Ranked List for the post of WOMAN FIRE AND RESCUE OFFICER (TRAINEE) FIRST NCA-
EZHAVA/THIYYA/BILLAVA on Rs. 20000-45800/-(PR) in FIRE AND RESCUE SERVICES

DEPARTMENT IN KOLLAM DISTRICT

NOTIFICATION

RemarksDOBReg.NoRank Name Commy

1 1014985 EZHAVA10/04/1997AISWARYA RAJ

2 1042054 EZHAVA11/04/1994ASWATHY K M

3 1081125 THIYYA30/04/1998AMRUTHA P G

4 1032742 EZHAVA01/06/1996NEETHU B

5 1053734 EZHAVA12/08/1996MINNU T D

6 1049210 EZHAVA07/12/2001PRABITHA PRAKASH

7 1020806 EZHAVA09/11/1997SNEHA BINU

8 1045097 EZHAVA02/06/2000KARTHIKA M
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NOTE (1) :-According to the existing procedure, revaluation of Answer script is not allowed. But Answer scripts will be
rechecked if the candidates apply for through their One Time Registration profile from the Commission's official
website by remitting the prescribed fee of Rs.85 (Rupees Eighty Five only). The fee can be remitted by e-payment
through the portal. Applications submitted in any other manner will not be considered. A period of 15 (Fifteen) days
time to apply for rechecking of Answer scripts will be allowed to candidates with effect from the date on which the
Ranked List is uploaded in the website of the Commission.

Note (2):- The entries put in column (5) are based on the Communities specified by the candidates in their Application
Forms and proved by them with necessary documents. The candidates whose Communities has not been correctly
noted in the Ranked List as proved by them in their Application should intimate the fact to the District Officer, Kerala
Public Service Commission District Office, Kollam-691001 within one month from the Date of publication of the
Ranked List to get the benefit of reservation to which they are entitled to. In the absence of timely information
regarding discrepancies, if any, the candidate will be advised as incorporated in the Ranked List.

NOTE (3) :- Candidates who wish to obtain a photocopy of their OMR Answer sheets (Part A & Part B) relating to the
selection shall submit online application through their One Time Registration profile from the official website of the
Commission, www.keralapsc.gov.in by remitting the prescribed fee of Rs.335 (Rupees Three Hundred and Thirty Five
only) via e-payment mode available in the portal. A period of 15 (Fifteen) days time to apply for photocopy of OMR
sheets will be allowed to candidates with effect from the date on which the Ranked List is uploaded in the website of
the Commission. Application submitted in any other manner will not be considered. A copy of the answer sheet will be
issued only once to the candidate. Copies of OMR sheets invalidated due to any defect will not be issued.

NOTE (4) :Candidates who wish to relinquish their claim for advice from the Ranked List shall submit an application in
the format presribed by the Commission to District Officer, Kerala Public Service Commission,District Office, Kollam-
691001.The format is available in the official website of the Commission. The request for relinquishment in respect of
those who do not submit the relinquishment application in the format prescribed by the Commission will not be
honoured under any circumstances. The request for relinquishment in the prescribed format should be duly attested
by a Gazetted Officer of State/Central Government with signature, name, designation and office seal along with a
Notarized Affidavit and a self attested copy of an ID Proof bearing photograph as enlisted in the General
conditions.The request for relinquishment along with the original of notarized affidavit and self attested copy of the ID
Proof received within 15 days from the date of publication of Ranked List in the Official website of the Commission will
be honoured against the requisitions of vacancies that are pending with the Commission up to the finalisation of
Ranked List. After the publication of the Ranked List, the request for relinquishment will be considered only if such
request is received on or before the date of receipt of vacancy, based on which she is to be advised.

NOTE (5) :- Since a common OMR test with common candidates was conducted for the post,the marks awarded to
the candidates included in the Ranked List will be published only after the publication of entire Ranked Lists (including
NCA notifications) which will be finalised on the basis of the common test. The result of rechecking of OMR
answerscript will be intimated in due course, but photocopy of OMR script will be issued only after the publication of
the Ranked Lists for all the posts finalised on the basis of the common test.

NOTE (6) :-The A part and B part of OMR scripts will be destroyed after completing 6 months period from the date of
finalization of the all Ranked Lists included in the common test held on 10.02.2024.

E - Ezhava/Thiyya/Billava



3 WOMAN FIRE AND RESCUE OFFICER (TRAINEE) FIRST
NCA-EZHAVA/THIYYA/BILLAVA

No.

Office of the Kerala Public Service Commission
District Office, KOLLAM

(Approved for Issue),

Section Officer

( By Order of the Commission )

THANKAM T A
DISTRICT OFFICER

KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
District Office, KOLLAM


